August 22, 2016








Salmon, Idaho
The board of County Commissioners met in regular session pursuant to recess of August 8, 2016 with John Jakovac, Chairman and Ken Miner present.  The minutes of the meeting of August 22, 2016 were approved.  

IN THE MATTER OF DEPARTMENT HEADS

The Board reviewed a letter from Sheriff Lynn Bowerman announcing his retirement on October 30, 2016.  The Board will get an opinion from attorney Withers as to whether the board can appoint the Chief Deputy to act in the absence of the Sheriff until the newly elected Sheriff is sworn in January, 2017.

EMS Director Janet Nelson presented SHSP grant funding documents for the board to review and sign.  Landfill Manager Ken Boese reported on recycling, the DEQ Voluntary Consent order and the group discussed contacting the BLM about getting the boundaries of the proposed expansion of the landfill surveyed.  WUI Director Karin Drnjevic reported on recent meetings with Salmon Valley Stewardship and the Idaho Department of Lands.
Probation Administrator Tom Fitte will be attending the Juvenile Justice Association’s September Conference.  He then reported on the tracking informal and transfer probation cases as well a training he attended with the Juvenile Justice in St. Anthony.  Road and Bridge Supervisor Kerrie Cheney reported that they have completed 15 to 16 miles of chip sealing and will be assisting the City with street chip sealing this week.  He informed the Board that all instream work is completed for the Allen Bridge and they are ready for the girders.  He also updated the board on Dowton Bridge and the Agency Creek Bridge.  His crew with assistance from the Forest Service, Formation Capital and Blackburn Mine will be grading Williams Creek this week.  
Commissioner Jakovac reported that he attended a meeting concerning the Shoup Bridge replacement and the prep work will begin now and the actual bridge work will begin this next spring.  Weed Supervisor Jeremey Varley reported that he will be seeking applicants for the office assistant position held by Danita King who will be moving.  He reported that the Youth Bio Control Collections will be held on the 29th.  He updated the Board on items completed and upcoming.   Building Official Gary Goodman gave the Board an update on the phone installations and that the Planning and Zoning committee are reviewing models addressing little houses, R.V.’s, private airports as well as updates to FEMA regulations.
The following ordinance was adopted.

ORDINANCE NO. 2016-1
AN ORDINANCE OF LEMHI COUNTY, A MUNICIPAL CORPORATION OF THE STATE OF IDAHO, ADOPTING THE 2015 VERSION OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE, PARTS I-IV AND IX, THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE , THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE AND THE 2012INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE, THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE, THE 2012 EXISTING BUILDING CODE, THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL PERFORMANCE CODE, THE FEE SCHEDULE FOUND IN THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL-2012 IRC APPENDIX L; PROVIDING EXCEPTIONS AND AMENDMENTS THERETO; PROVIDING FOR FEES, PROVIDING THAT A PERMIT IS REQUIRED FOR INSTALLATION OF A MOBILE/MANUFACTURED HOME, PROVIDING FOR EXEMPTIONS; PROVIDING FOR SEVERABILITY; REPEALING CONFLICTING ORDINANCES AND PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF LEMHI COUNTY, IDAHO:
Section 1.
 Code Adoption: That the editions of the following recognized codes as currently adopted by the state of Idaho as the official building codes of Lemhi County, except as provided in Section 2:
The adopted versions of the foregoing codes shall be effective January 1, 2014. The foregoing codes shall be deemed superseded by successive versions of such codes as they are adopted or approved by the state of Idaho effective on the 1st day of January the year following the date any such codes are made effective for the state, unless a different date is required by state statute.
Lemhi County hereby adopts the statutory provisions of Idaho Code Section 54-5017, which statue requires certain Mechanical and Fuel Gas activities be permitted by the Lemhi County Building Department. Further, that the fee schedule adopted by the State of Idaho, Division of Building Safety, HVAC Bureau, as passed by resolution by Lemhi County.

Section 2. 
Amendments to Adopted Codes: That the following amendments shall be applicable to the adopted building codes:

A. To the 2015 International Building Code:

a. Delete section 305.2.3 and replace with the following; Twelve (12) or fewer children in a dwelling unit. A facility such as the above within a dwelling unit and having twelve (12) or fewer children receiving such day care shall be classified as Group R-3 occupancy or shall comply with the International Residential Code.

b. Delete section 308.6.4 and replace with the following; Persons receiving care in a dwelling unit. A facility such as the above within a dwelling unit and having twelve (12) or fewer children receiving day care or having five (5) or fewer persons receiving custodial care shall be classified as a Group R-3 occupancy or shall comply with the International Residential Code. 

c. Delete section 310.5 and replace with the following; Residential Group R-3. Residential occupancies where the occupants are primarily permanent in nature and not classified as Group R-1, R-2 R-4, E or I, including.

i. Buildings that do not contain more than two (2) dwelling units;

ii. Boarding houses (nontransient with sixteen (16) or fewer occupants;

iii. Boarding houses (transient) with ten (10) or fewer occupants;

iv. Care facilities that provide accommodations for five (5) or fewer persons receiving care;

v. Congregate living facilities (non transient) with sixteen (16) or fewer occupants;

vi. Congregate living facilities (transient) with ten (10) or fewer occupants; or 

vii. Dwelling unites providing day care for twelve (12) or fewer children.

d. Delete section 310.5.1 and replace with the following; Care facilities within a dwelling. Care facilities for twelve (12) or fewer children receiving day care or for five (5) or fewer persons receiving care that are within a single-family dwelling are permitted to comply with the International Residential Code. 

e.  Amend IBC section 907.2.3- Group E as follows:

i. Delete exception No. 1 contained under IBC section 907.2.3- Group E, and replace with the following: A manual fire alarm system is not required in Group E occupancies with an occupant load of fifty (50) or less.

ii. Add the flowing as exception No. 2 under IBC section 907.2.3 - Group E: Emergency voice/alarm communication systems meeting the requirements of Section 907.5.2.2, and installed in accordance with Section 907.6 shall not be required in Group E occupancies with occupant loads of one hundred (100) or less, provided that activation of the manual fire alarm system initiates an approved occupant notification signal in accordance with Section 907.5
iii. Re-number exception No. 2 as exception No. 3 under IBC section 907.2.3 - Group E.
iv. Delete exception No. 3 and replace with the following as exception No 4: Manual fire alarm boxes shall not be required in Group E occupancies where all of the following apply:
1. 4.1 The building is equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1.
2. 4.2 The emergency voice/alarm communication system will activate on sprinkler water flow.
3. 4.3 Manual activation is provided from a normally occupied location.
f. Delete footnote (f) contained under Table 2902.1 Minimum Number of Required Plumbing 
Fixtures, and replace with the following: Drinking fountains are not required for an occupant load of thirty (30) or fewer.
g. Delete footnote (g) contained under Table 2902.1 Minimum Number of Required Plumbing 
Fixtures and replace with the following: For business occupancies, excluding restaurants, and mercantile occupancies with an occupant load of thirty (30) or fewer, service sinks shall not be required.
B. International Residential Code. 2012 Edition with the following amendments:
a. Delete exception No. 1 contained under IRC section R101.2 - Scope.
b. Delete exception No. 2 contained under IRC section R101.2 - Scope, and replace with the following: Owner-occupied lodging houses with five (5) or fewer guestrooms shall be permitted to be constructed in accordance with the International Residential Code for One- and Two-family Dwellings.
c. Delete item No. 7 contained under the "Building" subsection of IRC section R105.2 - Work exempt from permit, and replace with the following: Prefabricated swimming pools that are not greater than four (4) feet (one thousand, two hundred nineteen (1219) mm) deep.
d. Add the following item No. 11 at the end of the "Building" subsection of IRC section 8105.2 -Work exempt from permit: Flag poles.
e. Delete IRC section 8109.1.3 and replace with the following: Floodplain inspections. For construction in areas prone to flooding as established by Table R301.2(1), upon placement of the lowest floor, including basement, the building official is authorized to require submission of documentation of the elevation of the lowest floor, including basement, required in section R322.
f. IRC Table R302.1(1) Exterior Walls delete Table R302.1(1) and replace with the following:
TABLE R302.1 (1) 
EXTERIOR WALLS
	EXTERIOR WALL ELEMENT
	MININIUM FIRE-RESISTANCE 
RATING
	MINIMU M FIRE 
SEPARATION 
DISTANCE

	Walls
	Fire-resistance rated
	1hour-tested in accordance with 
ASTM E 119 or UL263 with 
exposure from both sides
	< 3 feet

	
	Not fire-resistance rated
	0 hours
	3 feet

	Projections
	Fire-resistance rated
	1 hour on the underside
	z 2 feet to < 3 feet

	
	Not fire-resistance rated
	0 hours
	3 feet

	Openings 
In 
Walls
	Not allowed
	N/A
	< 3 feet

	
	25% maximum of wall area
	0 hours
	Z 3 feet to < 5 feet

	
	Unlimited
	0 hours
	5 feet

	Penetrations
	All
	Comply with Section R302.4
	< 3 feet

	
	
	None required
	3 feet


g. Delete the exception contained under IRC section R302.2—Townshouses, and replace with the following two (2) exceptions:

i. When provided with an automatic fire sprinkler system per section R313.1, a common one (1)-hour such walls do not contain plumbing or mechanical equipment, ducts, or vents in the cavity of the common wall. The wall shall be rated for fire exposure from both sides, and shall extend to and be tight against exterior walls and the underside of the roof sheathing. Penetrations of electrical outlet boxes shall be in accordance with Section 8302.4.
ii. Two (2) one (1)-hour fire-resistance-rated wall assemblies (as specified in Section 8302.1) or a 
common two (2)-hour fire-resistance-rated wall assembly tested in accordance with ASTM E 119 or UL 263 are permitted for townhouses. If two (2) one (1)-hour fire-resistance-rated walls are used, plumbing and electrical installations within the wall cavity shall conform to fire-resistance penetration requirements in accordance with section R302.4 through R302.4.2 for each of the two (2) one (1)-hour rated walls penetrated. The two (2)-hour fire​ resistance-rated common wall shall not contain plumbing or mechanical equipment, ducts or vents within its wall cavity. The wall shall be rated for fire exposure from both sides, and shall extend to and be tight against the exterior walls and the underside of the roof sheathing. Penetrations of electrical outlet boxes shall be in accordance with Section R302.4
h. Delete IRC section R303.4 and replace with the following: 8303.4 Mechanical Ventilation. Dwelling units shall be provided with whole-house mechanical ventilation in accordance with Section M1507.3
Exception: Where the air infiltration rate of a dwelling unit is equal to 5 air changes per hour or greater when tested with a blower door at a pressure of 0.2 inch WC. (50 pa) in accordance with Section N1102.4.1.2.
i. Delete the exception contained under IRC section R313.1 -- Townhouse automatic fire sprinkler systems, and replace with the following: Exception: Automatic residential fire sprinkler systems shall not be required in townhouses where either two (2) one (1)-hour fire-resistance-rated walls or a common two (2)-hour fire-resistance rated wall, as specified in exception 2 of section R302.2 is installed between dwelling units or when additions or alterations are made to existing townhouses that do not have an automatic residential fire sprinkler system installed.
j. Delete IRC section R313.2
k. Add the following to IRC section R315.3 - Where required In existing dwellings: Exceptions: 1. Work involving the exterior surfaces of dwellings, such as, but not limited to, replacement of roofing or siding, or the addition or replacement of windows or doors, or the addition of a porch or deck or electrical permits, are exempt from the requirements of this section; and 2. Installation, alteration or repairs of non combustion plumbing or mechanical systems are exempt from the requirements of this section. 
l. Delete IRC section R322.1.10.
m. Delete IRC section R322.2.2 subparagraph 2,2, and replace with the following: The total net area of all openings shall be at least one (1) square inch (645 mm2) for each square foot (0.093 in2) of enclosed area, or the opening shall be designed and the construction documents shall include a statement that the design and installation of the openings will provide for equalization of hydrostatic flood forces on exterior walls by allowing the automatic entry and exit of floodwaters.
n. Delete IRC section R501.3 and its exceptions.
o. Delete IRC section R602.10 and replace with the following: Wall bracing. Buildings shall be braced in accordance with this section or, when applicable section R602.12, or the most current edition of APA System Report SR-102 as an alternate method. Where a building, or portion thereof, does not comply with one (1) or more of the bracing requirements in this section, those portions shall be designated and constructed in accordance with section R301.1
p. Chapter 11 IRE] Energy Efficiency - The following sections and tables of chapter 11 shall be amended In accordance with the requirements contained below in Subsection 004.04 of these rules which correspond  to the appropriate section:
i. Table N1102.1.1 (Table 8402.1.1) - Insulation and Fenestration Requirements by Component;
ii. Table N1102.1.3 (Table 8402,1.3 - Equivalent U.-Factors;
iii. Table N1102.2.6 (Table R402.2.6) - Steel-Frame Ceiling, Wall and Floor Insulation (R-Value);
iv. Section N1102.4.1 (R402.4.1) Building Thermal Envelope;
v. Section N1102.4.1.1 (R402.4.1.1) - Insulation;
vi. Table N1102.4.1.1 (Table R402,4.1.1) - Air Barrier and Insulation Installation;
vii. Section N1102.4.1.2 (R402.4.1.2) Testing Option;
viii. Add Section N1102.4.1.3 (R402.4.1.3) - Visual Inspection Option;
ix. Add Section N1102.6 (R402.6) - Residential Log Home Thermal Envelope;
x. Add Table N1102,6 (Table R402.6) - Log Home Prescriptive Thermal Envelope Requirements by Component; and
xi. Section N1104.1 (R404.0 - Lighting Equipment,
C. International Existing Building Code, 2012 Edition.
D. International Energy Conservation Code. 2012 Edition with the following amendments.
a. Add the following as new subsection C101.5.3: Industrial, electronic, and manufacturing equipment. Buildings or portions thereof that are heated or cooled exclusively to maintain the required operating temperature of industrial, electronic, or manufacturing equipment shall be exempt from the provisions of this code. Such buildings or portions thereof shall be separated from connected conditioned space by building thermal envelope assemblies complying with this code.
b. Delete the values contained in Table 8402.1.1 (Table N1102.1.1) for climate zone "5 and Marine 4" and climate zone "6" and replace with the following:
	TABLE R402,1.1 
INSULATION AND FENESTRATION REQUIREMENTS BY COMPONENT

	Climate 
Zone
	Fenestration 
U- Factor
	Skylight 
U-factor
	Glazed 
Fenestration 
SHGC


	Ceiling 
R-Value
	Wood 
Frame 
Wall
R -Value
	Mass Wall
R-Value
	Floor 
R-Value
	Basement Wall
R-Value

	Slab
R-Value

	Crawlspace 
Wall 
R-Value

	5 and 
Marine 4
	0.35
	0.60
	NR
	38
	20 or

13+5h
	13117
	309
	10/13
	10, 2 ft
	10/13

	6
	0.35
	0.60
	NR
	49
	20 or

13 +5h
	16/19
	309
	15/19
	10, 4 ft
	10/13


c. Add the following footnote to the title of Table 8402.1.1 - Insulation and Fenestration Requirements by Component: k. for residential log home building thermal envelope construction requirements see section R402.6.
d. Delete the values contained in Table R402.1.3 (Table N1102.1.3) for climate zone "5 and Marine 4" and climate zone "6" and replace with the following:
	TABLE R402.1.3 
EQUIVALENT U-FACTORS

	Climate 
Zone
	Fenestration 
U-factor
	Skylight 
U-factor
	Ceiling 
R-Value
	Wood Frame Wall R-Value


	Mass Wall R- Value

a 
R Value
	Floor

R-Value


	Basement Wall R-Value


	Crawlspace 

R-Value



	5 and 
Marine 4
	0.35
	0.60
	0.030
	0.057
	0.082
	0.033
	0.059
	0.065

	6
	0.35
	0.60
	0.026
	0.057
	0.060
	0.033
	0.050
	0.065


e. Delete Table 8402.2.6 (Table N1102.2.6) and replace with the following:
	TABLE R402.2.6 
STEEL-FRAME CEILING, WALL AND FLOOR INSULATION 
(R-VALUE)

	Wood Frame 
R-value Requirement
	Cold-formed Steel Equivalent R-valuea

	Steel Truss Cellingsb

	R-30
	R-38 or R-30 + 3 or R-26 + 5

	R-38
	R-49 or R-38 +3

	R-49
	R-38 + 5

	Steel Joist Ceilings b

	R-30
	R-38in 2 x 4 or 2 x 6 or 2 x 8 R-491n any framing

	R-38
	R-49in 2 x 4 or2 x 6 or2 x 8 or 2 x 10

	Steel-Framed Wall

	R-13
	R-13 + 5 or R-15 + 4 or R-21 + 3 or R-0 + 10

	R-19
	R-13+ 9 or R-19 + 8 or R-25 + 7

	R-21
	R-13 + 10 or R-19 + 9 or R-25 + 8

	Steel Joist Floor

	R-13
	R-19 In 2x6

R-19 +6 in 2x8 or 2x10

	R-19
	R-19+6 In 2x6

R-19+ 12 In 2 x 8 or 2 x 10

	a.  Cavity insulation R-value is listed first, followed by continuous Insulation R-value.

b. Insulation exceeding the height of the framing shall cover the framing.


f. Delete section R402.4.1 (N1102.4.1) and replace with the following: Building thermal envelope. The building thermal envelope shall comply with sections R402.1.1 and either section R402.4.1.2 or 8402.4.1.3. The sealing methods between dissimilar materials shall allow for differential expansion and contraction
g. Delete section 8402.4.1.1 (N1102.4.1.1) and replace with the following: Installation. The components of the building thermal envelope as listed in Table 8402.4.1.1 shall be installed in accordance with the manufacturer's instructions and the criteria listed in Table 8402.4.1.1, as applicable to the method of construction
h. Delete the criteria requirement for the "Fireplace" component of Table 8402.4.1.1 (Table N1102.4.1.1) - Air Barrier and Insulation Installation, and replace with the following: An air barrier shall be installed on fireplace walls.
i. Delete section R402.4.1.2 (N1102.4.1.2) and replace with the following: Testing option, Building envelope tightness and insulation installation shall be considered acceptable when tested air leakage is less than seven (7) air changes per hour (ACH) when tested with a blower door at a pressure of 33.5 psf (50 Pa). Testing shall occur after rough in and after installation of penetrations of the building envelope, including penetrations for utilities, plumbing, electrical, ventilation and combustion appliances. During testing:
i. Exterior windows and doors, fireplace and stove doors shall be closed, but not sealed;
ii. Dampers shall be closed, but not sealed, including exhaust, intake, makeup air, back draft and flue dampers;
iii. Interior doors shall be open;
iv. Exterior openings for continuous ventilation systems and heat recovery ventilators shall be closed and sealed;
v. Heating and cooling system(s) shall be turned off;
vi. HVAC ducts shall not be sealed; and
vii. Supply and return registers shall not be sealed.
j. Add the following as section R402.4.1.3 (N1102.4.1.3): Visual inspection option, Building envelope tightness and insulation installation shall be considered acceptable when the items listed in Table R402.4.1.1, applicable to the method of construction, are field verified. Where required by code official an approved party independent from the installer of the insulation shall inspect the air barrier and Insulation.
k. Add the following section: R402.6 (N1102.6) Residential Log Home Thermal Envelope. Residential log home construction shall comply with sections 8401 (General), R402.4 (Air Leakage), 8402.5 Maximum Fenestration U-Factor and SHGC), R403.1 (Controls), R403.2.2 (Sealing), R403.2.3 (Building Cavities), sections R403.3 through R403.9 (referred to as the mandatory provisions), Section R404 (Electrical Power and Lighting Systems), and either i,ii or iii as follows:
i. Sections R402.2 through R402.3, R403,2.1, 8404.1 and Table R402.6;
ii. Section R405 Simulated Performance Alternative (Performance); or
iii. REScheck (U.S. Department of Energy Building Codes Program)
l. Add Table 8402.6 (Table N1102.6) Log Home Prescriptive Thermal Envelope Requirements By Component to be used only in accordance with item I. of section R402 6 above to appear as follows:
LOG HOME PRESCRIPTIVE THERMAL ENVELOPE REQUIREMENTS BY COMPONENT

	CLIMATE ZONE
	FENSTRATION FACTOR ͣ
	SKYLIGHT U-FACTOR
	GLAZED FENSTRATION SHGC
	CEILING R-VALUE
	MIN AVERAGE LOG SIZE IN INCHES
	FLOOR R-VALUE
	BASEMENT WALL R-VALUE ͩ
	SLAB R-VALUE & DEPTH ᵇ
	CRAWL SPACE WALL R-VALUE ᵈ

	5, 6- High Efficiency Equipment Path ͨ
	0.32
	0.60
	NR
	49
	5
	30
	15/19
	10, 4ft
	10/13

	5
	0.32
	0.60
	NR
	49
	8
	30
	10/13
	10, 2ft
	10/13

	6
	0.30
	0.60
	NR
	49
	8
	30
	15/19
	10, 4ft
	10/13

	a. The fenestration U-factor column excludes skylights. The SHGC column applies to all glazed fenestration.

b. R-5 shall be added to the required slab edge R-values for heated slabs

c. 90% AFUE natural gas or propane, 84% AFUE oil, or 15 SEER heat pump heating equipment (zonal electric resistance heating equipment such as electric base board electric resistance heating equipment as the sole source for heating is considered compliant with the high efficiency equipment path.)

d. “15/19” means R-15 continuous insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home or R-19 cavity insulation at the interior of the basement wall. “15/19” shall be permitted to be met with R-13 cavity insulation on the interior of the basement wall plus R-5 continuous insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home. “10/13” means R-10 continuous insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home or R-13 cavity insulation at the interior of the basement wall. 


m. Delete section R404.1 (N1104.1) and replace with the following: Lighting equipment (Mandatory). A minimum of fifty percent (50%) of the lamps in permanently installed lighting fixtures shall be high-efficacy lamps or a minimum of fifty percent (50%) of the permanently installed lighting fixtures shall contain only high efficacy lamps.
Section 3.
Ground Snow Load: The ground snow load shall be determined by the Lemhi County Building Department

Section 4.
Minimum Frost Depth for Footings: The minimum frost depth for footings shall be 36 inches below grade

Section 5.
Permit Fees: Applicants shall pay permit fees in amounts to be determined by the Lemhi County Commissioners as passed by resolution by Lemhi County. All permits required under this Ordinance, requires fees to be paid prior to the permit being issued, unless otherwise allowed by the Lemhi County Commissioners.

Section 6.
Mobile and Manufactured Homes Installation Permits: Moving and/or placement of mobile/manufactured homes shall require a mobile home permit on forms provided by the Lemhi County Building Department. The permit applicant shall supply the Building Official the same site information required from an applicant seeking a building permit for a single family dwelling and shall pay a permit fee as passed by resolution by Lemhi County. 

E. All manufactured Homes must be installed in accordance with the manufacturer’s approved installation instructions. If manufacturer’s installation instructions are unavailable mobile and manufactured homes shall be installed in accordance with the Idaho Manufactured Home Installation Standard, as provided by rule pursuant to Title 44 Chapter 22 of Idaho Code.
Section 7.
Permanent Living Quarters: Nothing within this Ordinance shall be construed to allow a camping trailer, licensed vehicle or trailer, tent, recreational vehicle, or any other vehicle, accessory structure, or item as a permanent dwelling. No parcel can be used for temporary living quarters for a period of more than 6 months in a 12 month period, unless permitted for use as specified under an approved special use permit by the Lemhi County Planning & Zoning Commission for a campground or recreational vehicle park.
F.
All structures built for use as a living quarters for any amount of time, including “tiny houses”, must fall into one of the following classifications and are required to comply with the requirements for that classification.

a. Site Built- A building constructed at the location where it is to be used. Not intended or designed to be moved.

b. Modular Building- Any building or building component other than a manufactured home that is of closed construction and either entirely or substantially prefabricated or assembled at a place other than the building site I.C 39-4301

c. Manufactured Home- A structure built in compliance with HUD manufactured home construction and safety standards established under 42 U.S.C. section 5401 et seq. I.C 39-4105

d. Recreational Vehicle- A motor home, travel trailer, truck camper or camping trailer designed for recreational or emergency human habitation I.C. 49-119 Park trailers are recreational vehicles. Maximum width is 8 ½ feet.

i. Defined I.C. 39-4201- “Recreational vehicle" means a vehicular type unit primarily designed as temporary living quarters for recreational, camping, or travel use, which either has its own motive power or is mounted on or drawn by another vehicle.
Section 8.
Exemption; Idaho Code 39-4116 (5) agricultural building exemption.

G. Definitions;

a. “Agricultural Building” means a structure that is designed and constructed for one or more of the following purposes;

i. Livestock shelters or buildings, including shad structures and milking barns;

ii. Poultry buildings or shelter;

iii. Barns;

iv. Storage of equipment and machinery used exclusively in agriculture;

v. Horticultural structures, including detached production greenhouses and crop protection shelters;

vi. Sheds, but not sheds that are connected to public utilities, and/or on permanent foundations that are used as shops or garages;

vii. Grain silos; or

viii. Stables

b. “Equipment and machinery used exclusively in agriculture” means farm implements and other equipment and machinery that are used exclusively on land actively devoted to agriculture, and are not used on public highways except as necessary for access to land actively devoted to agriculture.

c. “Land actively devoted to agriculture” means real property meeting the 

Eligibility criteria for appraisal, assessment and taxation as agriculture property as set forth in Idaho Code 63-604.

d. The above definitions shall supersede any definition of these terms that are contained in the IBC

H. Exemption from Building Code Requirements. A building that meets the definition of “agricultural building” contained in subsection (G) above shall be exempt from the requirements of the building codes enumerated in Chapter 41, Title 39, Idaho Code, and the rules promulgated by the Idaho Building Code Board, to the extend such exemption is provided in Idaho Code 39-4116, provided that both of the following criteria are met;

a. The building is used solely for one or more of the purposes listed in subsection (G) (a) above; and

b. The property on which the building is sited has been determined by the Lemhi County Assessor to be land actively devoted to agriculture.

I. Requirements applicable to Agricultural Buildings. Notwithstanding any other provision of the ordinance, the following requirements shall apply to agricultural buildings.

a. An agricultural buildings shall not be;

i. Used as a place of human habitation; or

ii. Used as a place of employment where agricultural products are processed, treated or packaged; or

iii. Open to use by the public; or

iv. A shop and/or machinery repair building; or

v. A garage or building used for storage of personal use vehicles and/or vehicles licensed for use on public roads.

b. All agricultural buildings shall conform to the minimum placement standards established pursuant to the Lemhi County Development Code.

c. All agricultural buildings shall conform to the minimum snow, wind, frost, seismic, and all other engineering requirements of the code for safety reasons. 

d. The owner of an agricultural building will obtain a site permit for the building from the Lemhi County Building Department.

Section 9.
Notice of Non-Compliant Building, Structure and/or Appliance.
J. Definition of Non-Complaint Building, Structure and/or Appliance. Any building, structure and/or appliance that do not comply with the provisions of this ordinance and the codes adopted in this ordinance.

K. Commencement of Proceedings. When the building official has inspected or cause to be inspected any building, structure and/or appliance and has found that such building, structure and/or appliance is non-compliant, or the building official is unable to verify compliance because the required inspection have not been requested and performed, the building official shall commence proceedings to cause the repair or inspection of the building, structure and/or appliance. 

L. Notice and Order, and Appeal Process. The building official shall issue a notice and order directed to the record owner of the building, structure and/or appliance. The notice and order shall contain:


a. The street address, if issued, and a legal description or Assessor’s parcel number sufficient for identification of the premises upon which the building or structure is located.

b. A statement that the building official has found the building, structure and/or appliance to be non-compliant with a brief and concise description of the conditions found to render the building, structure and/or appliance non-compliant under the applicable provisions of the applicable code.

c. A statement of the action required to be taken as determined by the building official.

i. When the building official has determined that the building or structure must be repaired or inspected to comply with adopted codes, the order shall require that all required permits be secured if a permit is no longer valid and the work or inspection physically commenced within such time (not to exceed 10 days from the date of the order) and completed within such time as the building official shall determine is reasonable under the circumstances.

ii. A statement advising that if any required repair work or inspection is not completed within the time specified, the building official will fire a Certificate of a Non-Compliant Building, Structure and/or Appliance in the office of the County Recorder.

d. Statements advising; (1) that any person having any record title or legal interest in the building or structure may appeal from the notice and order or any action of the building official to the Board of Appeals, in accordance with the current International Residential Code; and (2) that failure to appeal will constitute a waiver of all right to an administrative hearing and determination of the matter. 

M. Service of Notice and Order. The notice and order, and any amended or supplemental notice and order, shall be served upon the record of owner. One copy thereof shall be served on each of the following if known to the building official or disclosed from official public records: the holder of any mortgage or deed of trust or other lien or encumbrance of record; the owner or holder of any lease or record; and the holder of any other state or legal interest of record in or to the building or structure or land on which it is located. The failure of the building official to serve any person required herein to be served shall not invalidate any proceedings hereunder as to any other person duly served or relieve any such person from any duty or obligation imposed by the provisions of this section. 
N. Method of Service. Service of the notice and order shall be made upon all persons entitled thereto either personally or by mailing a copy of such notice and order by 1st class mail, to each such person at their address as it appears on the last equalized assessment roll of the county or as known to the building official. If no address of any such person so appears or is known to the building official, then a copy of the notice and order shall be so mailed, addressed to such person, at the address of the building involved in the proceedings. The failure of any such person to receive such notice shall not affect the validity of any proceeding taken under this section. Service by certified mail in the manner herein provided shall be effective on the date of mailing. 
O. Proof of Service. Proof of service of the notice and order shall be certified to at the time of service by a written declaration under penalty of perjury executed by the person effecting service, declaring the date and manner in which service was made. The declaration or any receipt card returned in acknowledgment of receipt by certificate of mailing shall be affixed to the copy of the notice and order retained by the building official. 
P. Recordation of Non-compliance. If compliance is not had with the order within the time specified therein, and no appeal has been properly and timely filed, the building official shall file in the office of the County Recorder a certificate describing the property and certifying (i) that the building or structure is non-compliant and (ii) that the owner has been so notified. Whenever the corrections ordered shall thereafter have been completed or the building demolished so that it no longer exists on the property described in the certificate, the building official shall file a new certificate with the County Recorder certifying that the building has been demolished or all required corrections have been made so that the building is not longer non-compliant, whichever is appropriate. 
Q. Referral for Further Action. The building official shall notify the County Prosecutor’s office of completion of this proceeding and refer the matter to the County Prosecutor’s office for a determination of any further action. 
Section 10.
Severability. This ordinance is hereby declared to be severable. Should any portion of this ordinance be declared invalid by a court of competent jurisdiction, the remaining provisions shall continue in full force and effect and shall be read to carry out the purpose(s) of the ordinance before the declaration of partial invalidity.

Section 11.
Repeal of Conflicting Provisions. All provisions of ordinance number 2014-1 of Lemhi County and all other ordinances or parts of ordinances which conflict with the provisions of this ordinance are hereby repealed to the extent of such conflict. EXCEPTION: The “Lemhi County Development Code” is not repealed, nor any part of it. 

Section 12.
Penalties. The first violation of this ordinance by any person may result in a civil action seeking fines of one hundred dollars ($100.00) and/or to force compliance with the code provisions listed herein. The second violation of this ordinance, by a person who has previously been found to be in violation of this ordinance may result in a civil action seeking fines up to two hundred and fifty dollars ($250.00) and/or to force compliance with the code provisions listed herein. The third violation of this ordinance by a person who has previously been found to be in violation of this ordinance may result in a civil action seeking fines of up to five hundred dollars ($500.00) and/or to force compliance with the code provisions listed herein. Subsequent violations by a person found in violation of this ordinance on three prior occasions shall be a misdemeanor as described by Idaho Code 39-4126.

Section 13.
Effective Date. This ordinance shall be effective upon its passage and publication as provided by law.

Passed and Approved by the Board of County Commissioners of Lemhi County, Idaho this 22nd day of August, 2016

/s/ John Jakovac
Lemhi County Commissioner

Attest:

/s/ Terri J. Morton
Terri Morton, Clerk

IN THE MATTER OF CONTINENTAL DIVIDE TRAIL
Rachel Layman and Tim Carroll appeared before the Board to request a letter of support of the Salmon Valley Trails Committee application to become a Gateway Community for the Continental Divide Trail.  The Board presented them with a letter supporting their application.
IN THE MATTER OF DROUGHT DECLARATION

The Board received an Order Declaring Drought Emergency from the Department of Water Resources and approved by Governor Otter dated the 9th of August, 2016.

IN THE MATTER OF VOLUNTARY CONSENT ORDER FOR THE LEMHI COUNTY LANDFILL
The board reviewed and signed a Voluntary Consent Order between the County and the Department of Environmental Quality that addresses deficiencies found at the landfill in the 2015 Annual Audit.  

IN THE MATTER OF AIR QUALITY AND DEQ

DEQ officials Rensay Owen, Ryan Ross, Eric Neher and Pascale Warren appeared before the Board to discuss the county joining them in a program to address air quality improvements.  Ms. Warren reviewed the PM Advance Program and informed the Board that the City has joined and they would like to County to participate as well.  The group discussed several issues and the Board requested that they be furnished plans that other communities have submitted.  The matter was taken under advisement.

Ken Miner moved and John Jakovac seconded to go into executive session pursuant to Idaho Code 74-206(d) to hear Indigent matters.   A request to release a property lien was heard in Case 2006-34. 

Social Services Director Sue Dickens presented the following cases for consideration.  After convening in regular session the following decisions were entered.

Case No. 2006-34
Release lien subject to agreement with the parties was approved.


Case No. 2016-27
Approved

Case No. 2016-28
Denied

There being no further business, the board did adjourn until Tuesday, September 6, 2016 @ 6:00 p.m. for the Fiscal Year 2017 Budget Hearing.








/s/ John Jakovac           , Chairman

ATTEST:  /s/ Terri J. Morton                       , Clerk
524

